
 

 

Youth centre Hörstel 
 
The youth centre consists of four small 
centres, which are well equipped and 
can be reached by the visitors easily. 
They have different target groups: they 
work with children from 7 to 12 years 
but also with youth from 11 to 21 
years. They follow a low threshold 
approach which means that their 
activities should be open to everyone 
and easily accessable. They have an 
Internet Café, do educational work with 
media, have music related projects and 
outdoor education as well as gender 
related work with boys and girls. 
Additionally they organize activities for 
the holidays and a summer camps. 
  
 
 

 
 
 
District Steinfurt – Your home for a 
year 
During your stay in Germany you will 
live in a shared flat with other 
volunteers in district Steinfurt. With 
your bus ticket that you will get, you 
can travel trough the whole district and 
visit your new friends and bigger cities 
like Münster and Osnabrück.   
 

 
 
 
 
Your tasks as an European 
volunteer 
In the youth centers you can contribute 
your own ideas and make suggestions. 
As a member of a team you can tell 
your ideas and get support from your 
colleagues. Cooperation, 
communication and relationship work 
is one of your main tasks. You will 
work in two of the four houses. While 
playing games, talking and supporting 
the children you can get access to 
them.   
 
 


